
Things we love about our street-

This house is on a quiet cul-de-sac, close to amazing Wellington Point farm 
land and fresh vege (with café and farmers market coming soon).  This is a 
quiet street that takes you back to ‘The Wonder Years’...where kids can ride 
their bike in the court and play hand ball in the street without disturbing 
others. Where neighbours talk to each other and check in on one another but 
don’t get in each others business. The entire street is owner occupied and 
there’s always a willing person to put bins out, mow the grass or collect mail if 
you’re away. It’s a community of retirees and families, that have created that 
balance of respect and kindness without neighbourhood gossip. There’s 
usually a neighbourhood drink or two to be had before Christmas, and kids 
and grandkids play together happily outside without disturbing others. Most 
have dogs but you’d never know it, unless you happen to venture across 
them on their daily walks where there is always time for a friendly chat and 
pat. There are gorgeous breezes to be had all year round, only a short walk 
to the train station wellington point village and the horizon shops and medical 
facilities.  It is super quite at night, with only the odd possum, bird and 
occasional koala to be heard. 

Things we love about our house- 
  
We live outdoors and spend all year round in the alfresco area with friends 
and family.  The pool gets the morning sun so the water is a great 
temperature throughout the year.  It’s open plan, but there is also plenty of 
space to have ‘alone time’ to read, listen to music or just sit and relax.  The 
house was designed with practical living in mind, its low maintenance, has 
plenty of storage, and easy to live here.  I am going to miss both this house 
and the community very much when we move.


